
Mtg Mtg Date
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Director
ate

Manage
d by Implementation

Comp
lete

Current 
Due Date

Requested 
Revised Due Notes 

Portfoli
o Holder

SAC 12/10/2023

Report on 
the Public 
Engagement 
on 
Relocation of 
Troon Early 
Years ["EDUC"]

Valenti, 
Aileen

Relocation of Troon 
Early Years Centre Yes 31/08/2025

Kilbride, 
Martin;F
erry, 
Stephen
;Clark, 
Alec

SAC 12/10/2023

Report on 
the Public 
Engagement 
on 
Relocation of 
Troon Early 
Tears 

["SC and 
C"]

Kerr4, 
Laura

Relocation of Troon 
Library Yes 31/10/2024

Kilbride, 
Martin;F
erry, 
Stephen
;Clark, 
Alec

CAB 20/06/2023

External 
Event 
Funding

["SC and 
C"]

Kerr4, 
Laura

Funding agreements in 
place with external 
event partners. Yes 31/03/2024

Dowey, 
Martin;
Connoll
y, Brian

CAB 23/05/2023

Lease with 
Option to 
Purchase of 
the Foresters 
Hall, 44 New 
Road, Ayr ["CEO"]

Caves, 
Catriona Lease to be concluded Yes 30/11/2023

Council's offer of lease with 
option to purchase has now 
been accepted. Lease sent 
out for signing and awaiting 
return of same, with date of 
entry as at 01/10/2023.
Update 13/11/23 - 
transaction completed at 
1/10/23.

Kilbride, 
Martin
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Portfoli
o Holder

CAB 25/04/2023

Sale of 
Girvan 
Bandstand, 
Stair Park, 
Henrietta 
Street, 
Girvan

["H, O 
and D"]

Burns, 
Tom

Carry out a Common 
Good consultation under 
the Community 
Empowerment 
(Scotland) Act 2015 
Section 104; and 
thereafter bring a 
further report to Cabinet 
detailing the 
representations received Yes 30/11/2023

With Estates to carry out 
Common Good 
consultation and take 
responses back to Cabinet. 
Draft petition will be 
prepared by Legal services 
when required.

At the Cabinet Meeting on 
the 31 October 2023, it was 
agreed that the current due 
date of 30/09/2023 be 
amended to 30/11/2023.

Kilbride, 
Martin;
Clark, 
Alec

SAC 29/06/2023
Service Plans 
2023-2024

["SC and 
C"]

Anderso
n, Kevin

Quarterly report to 
Service
and Partnerships
Performance Panel Yes 21/11/2023

Q2 performance due to be 
considered by S&PPP in 
November.

CAB 31/10/2023

Strategic 
Housing 
Investment 
Plan (SHIP) – 
2024/25 to 
2028/29

["H, O 
and D"]

Carroll, 
Chris

Submission of the 
Strategic Housing 
Investment Plan (SHIP) 
in draft format (subject 
to final clearance) to the 
Scottish Government Yes 03/11/2023

Submitted to Scottish 
Government on 3 
November 2023 Kilbride, 

Martin

CAB 31/10/2023

Annual 
Procurement 
Report 2023 ["CEO"]

Alexand
er, 
David

Publication of Annual 
Procurement Report 
2023 Yes 01/11/2023

Pollock, 
Bob;Dav
is, Ian
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Portfoli
o Holder

CAB 20/06/2023

Redevelopm
ent of 
Former 
Hourstons 
Building and 
Arran Mall, 
Ayr

["H, O 
and D"]

Cox, 
Chris

Report to Cabinet with 
detailed proposals and 
demolition update Yes 31/10/2023

Report going to Cabinet on  
28 November 2023

Kilbride, 
Martin

SAC 01/03/2023

Public 
Engagement 
on 
Relocation of 
Troon Early 
Years  Centre ["EDUC"]

Valenti, 
Aileen Report to Council Yes 31/10/2023

Kilbride, 
Martin;F
erry, 
Stephen
;Clark, 
Alec

CAB 29/11/2022

Annual 
Climate 
Change Duty 
Report 2021-
22

["SC and 
C"]

Anderso
n, Kevin

Prepare annual report 
for 2023 Yes 31/10/2023

Report to be considered by 
Cabinet in November. 

Kilbride, 
Martin

CAB 29/08/2023

Penalty 
Charge 
Notice 
Increase

["H, O 
and D"]

Kevin 
Braidwo
od Apply PCN increase Yes 30/10/2023

implemented Monday 30 
October 2023

Pollock, 
Bob
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Portfoli
o Holder

NA 10/03/2022

Future 
Operating 
Model

["SC and 
C"]

Tait, 
Jamie

Provide a detailed report 
on the effectiveness of 
Thriving Communities 
shared model of delivery 
and the public 
consultation exercise. Yes 30/10/2023

Thriving Communities Year 
2 'The story so far' planned 
for August 2023

Report due September - 
Service and Performance 
October

At the Cabinet Meeting on 
31 October 2023, it was 
agreed that the current due 
date of 30/09/2023 to 
30/10/2023.

Dowey, 
Martin;
Davis, 
Ian

SAC 12/10/2023

Appointment
s to Panels 
and Working 
Groups 
(including 
change to 
Vice-Chair of 
South 
Ayrshire 
Integration 
Joint Board ["CEO"]

Carlaw, 
Wynne

publish details of 
membership of Panels 
and Working Groups Yes 20/10/2023

Dowey, 
Martin

SAC 12/10/2023

Standing 
Orders 
Relating to 
Meetings ["CEO"]

Caves, 
Catriona

updated standing orders 
relating to meetings to 
be published and 
notified to employees Yes 20/10/2023

Dowey, 
Martin
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Portfoli
o Holder

SAC 12/10/2023

Motion re 
Station 
Hotel, Ayr ["CEO"]

Newall, 
Mike

Letters to be sent to 
Scottish Government 
and UK Government Yes 13/10/2023

Kilbride, 
Martin

SAC 12/10/2023

SAC LLP 
(Nominees) 
Limited ["CEO"]

Briggs, 
Karen

where approved, lodge 
appropriate form with 
Companies House to 
update company 
information Yes 10/10/2023

Companies House 
information updated.

Dowey, 
Martin
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